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After reading an interesting article entitled “Early
Prediction of Maxillary Canine Impaction” in the
March 2016 issue of Dentomaxillofacial Radiology,1 we
had a few doubts we would like to share with the
authors: in the section “Methods and Materials”, we
were somehow confused about the final sample. In the
second paragraph, it is stated that the final sample
consisted of “…116 untreated patients with unilateral
canine impaction at T2”. However, in the fourth para-
graph, the authors reported that 30 subjects from the
test data set “…were selected from the 86 remaining
records that displayed bilateral maxillary canine erup-
tion at T2…”. We wondered where did these patients
come from?

We would also like to see a table with the compar-
ison between quantitative measurements at T2 canine
impaction vs non-impaction to help us understand

some of the values at T2 presented in the second par-
agraph of the “Results” section. It seems a little bit
strange for us that the angle between the canine and
the lateral incisor diminished at T2 on the impacted
side (213°) and increased on the non-impacted side,
but the position of the canine related to the midline
remained the same.

Literature shows us, in an impaction situation, lateral
incisors with distal crown tipping.2 Also it is expected,
in spontaneous eruption, that the canine position is less
inclined at this age (T2).

3 In view of the above, it would
be extremely gratifying to have a response to better
understand this article.
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